
PAYMENT SYSTEM 

(EASTERN CARIBBEAN AUTOMATED CLEARING HOUSE) 

(AMENDMENT) RULES 

 

[COUNTRY] 

 

STATUTORY INSTRUMENT NO……. OF 2015 

 

In exercise of the power conferred under section 33 of the Payment System Act, No. [  ] of [        

] of the laws of [                        ], the Central Bank makes these Rules:  

 

(Gazetted ……………..2015) 

 

1. Short title and commencement 

(1) These Rules may be cited as the PAYMENT SYSTEM (EASTERN 

CARIBBEAN AUTOMATED CLEARING HOUSE) (AMENDMENT) RULES 

2015 

 

(2) These Rules shall come into effect on the 1st day of April 2015. 

 

2. Interpretation 

In these Rules “the principal Rules” means the Payment System (Eastern Caribbean 

Automated Clearing House) Rules, No [         ]. 

 

3. Amendment of Schedule 4 

Schedule 4 of the principal Rules is amended by deleting the figure “$0.15” 

everywhere it appears in Column II-Fee and substituting it with the figure “$0.25”. 

 

Made this ……… day of March 2015. 

 

……………………………………… 

Governor 

Eastern Caribbean Central Bank  



PAYMENT SYSTEM 

(EASTERN CARIBBEAN AUTOMATED CLEARING HOUSE) 

(AMENDMENT) RULES 

 

ANTIGUA AND BARBUDA 

 

STATUTORY INSTRUMENT NO……. OF 2015 

 

In exercise of the power conferred under section 33 of the Payment System Act, No.15 of 

2007, the Central Bank makes these Rules:  

 

(Gazetted ……………..2015) 

 

1. Short title and commencement 

(1) These Rules may be cited as the PAYMENT SYSTEM (EASTERN 

CARIBBEAN AUTOMATED CLEARING HOUSE) (AMENDMENT) RULES 

2015 

 

(2) These Rules shall come into effect on the 1st day of April 2015. 

 

2. Interpretation 

In these Rules “the principal Rules” means the Payment System (Eastern Caribbean 

Automated Clearing House) Rules, No 28 of 2013. 

 

3. Amendment of Schedule 4 

Schedule 4 of the principal Rules is amended by deleting the figure “$0.15” 

everywhere it appears in Column II-Fee and substituting it with the figure “$0.25”. 

 

Made this ……… day of March 2015. 

 

……………………………………… 

Governor 

Eastern Caribbean Central Bank  



PAYMENT SYSTEM 

(EASTERN CARIBBEAN AUTOMATED CLEARING HOUSE) 

(AMENDMENT) RULES 

 

DOMINICA 

 

STATUTORY INSTRUMENT NO……. OF 2015 

 

In exercise of the power conferred under section 33 of the Payment System Act, No.4 of 

2009, the Central Bank makes these Rules:  

 

(Gazetted ……………..2015) 

 

1. Short title and commencement 

(1) These Rules may be cited as the PAYMENT SYSTEM (EASTERN 

CARIBBEAN AUTOMATED CLEARING HOUSE) (AMENDMENT) RULES 

2015 

 

(2) These Rules shall come into effect on the 1st day of April 2015. 

 

2. Interpretation 

In these Rules “the principal Rules” means the Payment System (Eastern Caribbean 

Automated Clearing House) Rules, 2013. 

 

3. Amendment of Schedule 4 

Schedule 4 of the principal Rules is amended by deleting the figure “$0.15” 

everywhere it appears in Column II-Fee and substituting it with the figure “$0.25”. 

 

Made this ……… day of March 2015. 

 

……………………………………… 

Governor 

Eastern Caribbean Central Bank  



PAYMENT SYSTEM 

(EASTERN CARIBBEAN AUTOMATED CLEARING HOUSE) 

(AMENDMENT) RULES 

 

GRENADA 

 

STATUTORY INSTRUMENT NO……. OF 2015 

 

In exercise of the power conferred under section 33 of the Payment System Act, No.11 of 

2009, the Central Bank makes these Rules:  

 

(Gazetted ……………..2015) 

 

1. Short title and commencement 

(1) These Rules may be cited as the PAYMENT SYSTEM (EASTERN 

CARIBBEAN AUTOMATED CLEARING HOUSE) (AMENDMENT) RULES 

2015 

 

(2) These Rules shall come into effect on the 1st day of April 2015. 

 

2. Interpretation 

In these Rules “the principal Rules” means the Payment System (Eastern Caribbean 

Automated Clearing House) Rules, No 8 of 2014. 

 

3. Amendment of Schedule 4 

Schedule 4 of the principal Rules is amended by deleting the figure “$0.15” 

everywhere it appears in Column II-Fee and substituting it with the figure “$0.25”. 

 

Made this ……… day of March 2015. 

 

……………………………………… 

Governor 

Eastern Caribbean Central Bank  



PAYMENT SYSTEM 

(EASTERN CARIBBEAN AUTOMATED CLEARING HOUSE) 

(AMENDMENT) RULES 

 

MONTSERRAT  

 

STATUTORY INSTRUMENT NO……. OF 2015 

 

In exercise of the power conferred under section 33 of the Payment System Act, No.5 of 

2008, the Central Bank makes these Rules:  

 

(Gazetted ……………..2015) 

 

1. Short title and commencement 

(1) These Rules may be cited as the PAYMENT SYSTEM (EASTERN 

CARIBBEAN AUTOMATED CLEARING HOUSE) (AMENDMENT) RULES 

2015 

 

(2) These Rules shall come into effect on the 1st day of April 2015. 

 

2. Interpretation 

In these Rules “the principal Rules” means the Payment System (Eastern Caribbean 

Automated Clearing House) Rules, No 63 of 2014. 

 

3. Amendment of Schedule 4 

Schedule 4 of the principal Rules is amended by deleting the figure “$0.15” 

everywhere it appears in Column II-Fee and substituting it with the figure “$0.25”. 

 

Made this ……… day of March, 2015. 

 

……………………………………… 

Governor 

Eastern Caribbean Central Bank  



PAYMENT SYSTEM 

(EASTERN CARIBBEAN AUTOMATED CLEARING HOUSE) 

(AMENDMENT) RULES 

 

ST CHRISTOPHER AND NEVIS 

 

STATUTORY INSTRUMENT NO……. OF 2015 

 

In exercise of the power conferred under section 33 of the Payment System Act, Cap. 20.57 

the Central Bank makes these Rules:  

 

(Gazetted ……………..2015) 

 

1. Short title and commencement 

(1) These Rules may be cited as the PAYMENT SYSTEM (EASTERN 

CARIBBEAN AUTOMATED CLEARING HOUSE) (AMENDMENT) RULES 

2015 

 

(2) These Rules shall come into effect on the 1st day of April 2015. 

 

2. Interpretation 

In these Rules “the principal Rules” means the Payment System (Eastern Caribbean 

Automated Clearing House) Rules, No 3 of 2014. 

 

3. Amendment of Schedule 4 

Schedule 4 of the principal Rules is amended by deleting the figure “$0.15” 

everywhere it appears in Column II-Fee and substituting it with the figure “$0.25”. 

 

Made this ……… day of March 2015. 

 

……………………………………… 

Governor 

Eastern Caribbean Central Bank  



PAYMENT SYSTEM 

(EASTERN CARIBBEAN AUTOMATED CLEARING HOUSE) 

(AMENDMENT) RULES 

 

SAINT LUCIA 

 

STATUTORY INSTRUMENT NO……. OF 2015 

 

In exercise of the power conferred under section 33 of the Payment System Act, No.10 of 

2010, the Central Bank makes these Rules:  

 

(Gazetted ……………..2015) 

 

1. Short title and commencement 

(1) These Rules may be cited as the PAYMENT SYSTEM (EASTERN 

CARIBBEAN AUTOMATED CLEARING HOUSE) (AMENDMENT) RULES 

2015 

 

(2) These Rules shall come into effect on the 1st day of April 2015. 

 

2. Interpretation 

In these Rules “the principal Rules” means the Payment System (Eastern Caribbean 

Automated Clearing House) Rules, No 79 of 2014. 

 

3. Amendment of Schedule 4 

Schedule 4 of the principal Rules is amended by deleting the figure “$0.15” 

everywhere it appears in Column II-Fee and substituting it with the figure “$0.25”. 

 

Made this ……… day of March 2015. 

 

……………………………………… 

Governor 

Eastern Caribbean Central Bank  



PAYMENT SYSTEM 

(EASTERN CARIBBEAN AUTOMATED CLEARING HOUSE) 

(AMENDMENT) RULES 

 

SAINT VINCENT AND THE GRENADINES  

 

STATUTORY INSTRUMENT NO……. OF 2015 

 

In exercise of the power conferred under section 33 of the Payment System Act, No.27 of 

2008, the Central Bank makes these Rules:  

 

(Gazetted ……………..2015) 

 

1. Short title and commencement 

(1) These Rules may be cited as the PAYMENT SYSTEM (EASTERN 

CARIBBEAN AUTOMATED CLEARING HOUSE) (AMENDMENT) RULES 

2015 

 

(2) These Rules shall come into effect on the 1st day of April 2015. 

 

2. Interpretation 

In these Rules “the principal Rules” means the Payment System (Eastern Caribbean 

Automated Clearing House) Rules, No 11 of 2013. 

 

3. Amendment of Schedule 4 

Schedule 4 of the principal Rules is amended by deleting the figure “$0.15” 

everywhere it appears in Column II-Fee and substituting it with the figure “$0.25”. 

 

Made this ……… day of March 2015. 

 

……………………………………… 

Governor 

Eastern Caribbean Central Bank 


